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ADOPTED - BOARD OF TRUSTEES

COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT NO. 508

MAY 7, 2009

BOARD OF TRUSTEES OF COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT NO.508
County of Cook and State of Illinois

PURCHASE AND DELIVERY OF AUTOMOTIVE TRAINING SYSTEM

TRUMAN COLLEGE
THE CHANCELLOR
REPORTS that there is a need to purchase an automotive training system for the Automotive
Technology Program of Truman College to allow the students to study and troubleshoot
twelve separate electrical/electronic systems simultaneously; and
that specifications were prepared by District staff, publicly advertised, and eleven (11)
vendors were notified; a pre-bid conference was held on March 3, 2009, and the following
two (2) firms submitted bids as listed below:
Item
Item NMTC, Inc. d/b/a Matco | Description
Description/Part # Tools /Part # JBH Technologies, Inc.
Brand Name Qty. Unit Price Ext. Price Alternate Qty. Unit Price Ext. Price
Consulab EM-200- ATech 822FJ
01 Analog Analog
1 t Dashboard 1 $2,150.00 | $2,150.00 | Dashboard $3,505.00 | $3,505.00
Consulab EM-200-
01 Analog Analog Dash
Dashboard with Board with
2 | PCM 1 $2,6560.00 | $2,650.00 | PCM No-Bid No-Bid
ATech 840F
Power
EM-200-02 Power Window
3 [ Window Trainer 1 $1,5650.00 | $1,550.00 | Trainer $1,830.00 | $1,830.00
ATech 850F
EM-200-03 Power Power Door
4 | Door Lock Trainer 1 $1,100.00 $1,100.00 | Lock Trainer $1,520.00 $1,520.00
EM-200-04 Horn ATech 832F
5 | Trainer 1 $650.00 $650.00 | Horn Trainer $2,445.00 | $2.445.00
ATech B6OF
EM-200-05 Power Power Seat
6 | Seat Trainer 1 $1.400.00 | $1,400.00 | Trainer $2,140.00 $2,140.00
EM-200-06 Wiper ATech 830F
7 | Trainer 1 $1,140.00 | $1,140.00 | Wiper Trainer $2,030.00 | $2,030.00
EM-200-09 Holder Holder for
for EM-200 EM 200
8 | products 1 $120.00 $120.00 | Products No-Bid No-Bid
EM-200-10 EM-200
9 | Cabinet 1 $995.00 $995.00 | Cabinet No-Bid No-Bid
Atech 320F -
Heater
EM-200-11 Heater Blower
10 | Blower Trainer 1 $1,285.00 $1,285.00 | Trainer $1,725.00 $1,725.00




EM-200-12 Distributor
Distributor trainer Trainer with
11 | with Hall Effect 1 $1,285.00 $1,285.00 | Hali Effect 1 | No-Bid No-Bid
ATech 700F
EM-200-14 Electronic
Electronic ignition Ignition
System D.1.S. GM System DIS
12 1 E.1. 2002 1 $2,050.00 $2,050.00 | GM 3.L 2002 1 $2,860.00 | $2,860.00
ATech 1551
EM-E00-07 Airbag Airbag
13 | Trainer 1 $3,400.00 | $3,400.00 | Trainer 1 $4630.00 | $4,630.00
Cruise
EM-300-08 Cruise Contro!
14 | Control Trainer 1 $3,375.00 $3,375.00 | Trainer 1 | No-Bid No-Bid

ATech 1771F

EM-300-16 Spark Spark
15 | Simulator 1 $1.745.00 $1,745.00 | Simulator 1 $3,890.00 $3,890.00
ATech
ANS16
Wireless
Wireless Network Network
16 | per trainer 13 $400.00 | $5,200.00 | peritrainer 1 $1,225.00 | $1,225.00
Atech 802

Shipping/Handling Charges $550.00

Shipping/Handling Charges $700.00

TOTAL BID PRICE | $30,645.00 TOTAL BID PRICE | $28,500.00

RECOMMENDS

FINANCIAL

that Truman staff has reviewed the bids submitted and has determined that based on the bid
submitted by the lowest responsive and responsible bidder, NMTC, Inc. d/b/a Matco Tools,
be awarded the provider of the automotive training system; and,

that the Office of M/WBE Contract Compliance has reviewed the above request to purchase
and, NMTC, Inc. d/b/a Matco Tools, a direct provider and supplier of the specific item has
requested a waiver for direct participation as there are no certified M/WBE firms to provide
or service the product, is recommending the approval of the waiver request for compliance
with the Board Approved Participation plan.

THE CHANCELLOR

that the Board of Trustees approves the issuance of a purchase order to NMTC, Inc. d/b/a
Matco Tools for the purchase and delivery of the above listed automotive training system to
Truman College for a total not to exceed amount of $30,645.00, in accordance with Bid
#MWI0903 dated February 13, 2009,

$30,645.00 — Perkins - 21000-4004000-10001-12121-559200

Respectfully Submitted:

Wayne D. Watson
Chancellor

May 7, 2009 — Truman College




