
Anchor Staffing, Inc. A-Pro Execs, LLC GIVEndeavors Infojini, Inc.  Inspiren Tech 
Solutions, LLC 

LaSalle Staffing, Inc. 
dba LaSalle Network

Manpower Group US, 
Inc. dba 

ManpowerGroup

M & M Staffing 
Agency, Inc.

9901 S. Western Ave. 208 S. LaSalle St.

1341 W. Fullerton Ave., #259

10015 Old Columbia Rd. 478 Elden St. 200 W. LaSalle St. 525 W. Monroe St. 1020 Park Drive

Chicago, IL 60643 Chicago, IL 60604
Chicago, IL 60614

Columbia, MD 21046 Herndon, VA 20170 Chicago, IL 60601 Chicago, IL 60661 Flossmoor, IL 60422

Junior $18.76 $20.65 NO BID $28.00 $38.27 $22.00 $20.85 $18.00

Mid-level $24.12 29..07 $40.00 $44.64 $25.00 $23.63 $21.00

Senior $29.48 $35.95 $52.00 $52.34 $28.00 $26.41 $23.00

Junior $28.14 $30.98 $42.00 $57.40 $33.00 $31.28 $27.00

Mid-level $36.18 $43.61 $60.00 $66.96 $37.50 $35.49 $31.50

Senior $44.22 $53.93 $78.00 $78.51 $42.00 $39.62 $34.50

Junior $28.14 $22.95 $42.00 $57.40 $33.00 $20.85 $18.00./$27.00

Mid-level $36.18 $30.60 $60.00 $66.96 $37.50 $23.63 $21.00/$31.50

Senior $44.22 $37.48 $78.00 $78.51 $42.00 $26.41 $23.00/$34.50

Junior $21.44 $24.48 NO BID $40.00 $56.34 $35.00 $46.00 $18.00

Mid-level $24.12 $32.13 $50.00 $68.24 $48.00 $67.00 $22.80

Senior $30.82 $39.78 $58.00 $89.94 $63.00 $88.00 $32.40

Junior $32.16 $36.72 $60.00 $84.51 $52.50 $69.00 $27.00

Mid-level $36.18 $48.20 $75.00 $102.36 $72.00 $100.50 $34.20

Senior $46.23 $59.67 $87.00 $134.91 $94.50 $132.00 $48.60

Junior $32.16 $26.77 $60.00 $84.51 $52.50 $46.00 $18.00/$27.00

Mid-level $3.18 $33.66 $75.00 $102.36 $72.00 $67.00 $22.80/$34.20

Senior $46.23 $42.00 $87.00 $134.91 $94.50 $88.00 $32.40/$48.60

Junior $21.44 $28.30 NO BID $40.00 $63.86 NO BID $22.24 $19.00

Mid-level $26.80 $32.89 $48.00 $95.46 $25.02 $22.00

Senior $40.20 $39.78 $55.00 $134.62 $27.80 $25.00

Junior $32.16 $42.45 $60.00 $97.29 $33.36 $28.50

Mid-level $40.20 $49.34 $70.00 $143.19 $37.53 $33.00

Senior $60.30 $59.67 $82.50 $201.93 $41.70 $37.50

Category B - Accounting & Financial 
Services

Monday-Friday Hourly 
Rate          (up to 40 

Hours)

Category A - Administrative Services

Over 40 Hours                     
Hourly Rate

Category A - Administrative Services

Category A - Administrative Services

Category B - Accounting & Financial 
Services

Monday-Friday    
Hourly Rate          (up to 

40 Hours)

Over 40 Hours                     
Hourly Rate

Category B - Accounting & Financial 
Services

Saturday / Sunday

Category C - Legal Services

BID RE-CAPITULATION

Saturday / Sunday

Category C - Legal Services

Monday-Friday Hourly 
Rate          (up to 40 

hours)

Over 40 Hours                     
Hourly Rate

Note:  The information contained on this page is for informational purposes only. It does not constitute a final determination and/or recommendation for approval by our Board of Trustees.

Position level

Days

CITY COLLEGES OF CHICAGO

Seald Bid #MWJ1904

Pre-Qualification - Temporary Agency Services - District Wide

Office of Human Resources

Bids Due:  August 20, 2019

Job Levels

Office of Administrative and Procurement Services



Junior $32.16 $30.60 $60.00 $97.29 $22.24 $19.00/$28.50

Mid-level $40.20 $35.19 $70.00 $143.19 $25.02 $22.00/$33.00

Senior $60.30 $42.50 $82.50 $201.93 $27.80 $25.00/$37.50

Junior $21.44 $28.30 $100.00 $55.00 $92.86 $70.00 $34.70 $25.00

Mid-level $26.80 $32.89 $125.00 $75.00 $119.68 $87.00 $37.53 $34.90

Senior $33.50 $39.78 $150.00 $94.00 $152.98 $102.00 $50.40 $38.00

Junior $32.16 $42.45 $100.00 $82.50 $139.29 $105.00 $52.13 $37.50

Mid-level $40.20 $49.34 $125.00 $112.50 $179.52 $130.50 $56.26 $52.35

Senior $50.25 $56.67 $150.00 $141.00 $229.47 $153.00 $75.60 $57.00

Junior $32.16 $30.60 $100.00 $82.50 $139.29 $105.00 $34.75 $25.00/$37.50

Mid-level $40.20 $35.19 $125.00 $112.50 $179.52 $130.50 $37.53 $34.90/$52.35

Senior $50.25 $42.50 $150.00 $141.00 $229.47 $153.00 $50.40 $38.00/$57.00

Junior $21.44 $28.30 NO BID $42.00 $62.76 $35.00 $26.41 $18.00

Mid-level $29.48 $32.89 $55.00 $82.64 $48.00 $29.19 $24.00

Senior $34.84 $39.78 $74.00 $129.16 $65.00 $33.36 $31.25

Junior $32.16 $42.45 $63.00 $94.14 $52.50 $39.62 $27.00

Mid-level $44.22 $49.34 $82.50 $123.96 $72.00 $43.79 $36.00

Senior $52.26 $56.67 $111.00 $193.74 $97.50 $50.04 $46.88

Junior $32.16 $30.60 $63.00 $94.14 $52.50 $26.41 $18.00/$27.00

Mid-level $44.22 $35.19 $82.50 $123.96 $72.00 $29.19 $24.00/$36.00

Senior $52.26 $42.50 $111.00 $193.74 $97.50 $33.36 $31.25/$46.88

Junior $22.78 $28.30 NO BID $45.00 $58.92 $35.00 $30.58 $22.50

Mid-level $26.80 $32.89 $60.00 $79.34 $48.00 $33.36 $29.00

Senior $40.20 $39.78 $75.00 $106.98 $65.00 $36.14 $33.00

Junior $34.10 $42.45 $67.50 $88.38 $52.50 $45.87 $33.75

Mid-level $40.20 $49.34 $90.00 $119.01 $72.00 $50.04 $43.50

Senior $60.30 $56.67 $112.50 $160.47 $97.50 $54.21 $49.50

Junior $34.17 $35.19 $67.50 $88.38 $52.50 $30.58 $22.50/$33.75

Mid-level $40.20 $35.19 $90.00 $119.01 $72.00 $33.36 $29.00/$43.50

Senior $60.30 $42.50 $112.50 $160.47 $97.50 $36.14 $33.00/$49.50

Weekend Hourly Rate

Category E - Marketing Services Monday-Friday Hourly 
Rate          (up to 40 

hours)

Category D - Managerial / Professional 
Services

Category E - Marketing Services
Over 40 Hours                     

Hourly Rate

Weekend Hourly Rate

Category F - Procurement Services

Over 40 Hours                     
Hourly Rate

Category F - Procurement Services

Weekend Hourly Rate

Weekend Hourly Rate

Category F - Procurement Services Monday-Friday Hourly 
Rate          (up to 40 

hours)

Category E - Marketing Services

Monday-Friday Hourly 
Rate          (up to 40 

hours)

Category D - Managerial / Professional 
Services

Over 40 Hours                     
Hourly Rate

Category D - Managerial / Professional 
Services

Category C - Legal Services



Mind Your Manners 
dba The William 

Everett Group

Premier Staffing 
Source, Inc.

Robert Half 
International, Inc.

Zion Cloud Solutions, 
LLC

35 E.Wacker Dr., Suite 
3100

4640 Forbes Blvd. 205 N. Michigan Ave. 2700 Patriot  Blvd., 
#250

Chicago, IL 60601 Lanham, MD 20706 Chicago, IL 60601 Glenview, IL 60026

NO BID $21.60 $25.25 $23.00

$31.39 $33.50 $33.00

$45.56 $42.00 $39.00

$32.40 $37.88 $25.00

$47.08 $50.25 $35.00

$68.34 $63.00 $41.00

$32.40 $25.25 $25.00

$47.08 $33.50 $35.00

$68.34 $42.00 $41.00

NO BID $32.40 $33.50 $36.00

$52.76 $45.00 $48.00

$60.75 $65.00 $58.00

$48.60 $50.25 $38.00

$79.14 $67.50 $50.00

$91.13 $97.50 $61.00

$48.60 $50.25 $38.00

$79.14 $67.50 $50.00

$91.13 $97.50 $61.00

NO BID $27.34 $55.00 $38.00

$40.42 $75.00 $45.00

$51.86 $150.00 $55.00

$41.01 $82.50 $40.00

$60.63 $112.50 $47.00

$77.80 $225.00 $57.00

 

                            

   

  

       

   

     

     



$41.01 $82.50 $40.00

$60.63 $112.50 $47.00

$77.80 $225.00 $57.00

$85.00 $62.32 $50.00 $38.00

$100.00 $81.49 $70.00 $46.50

$125.00 $95.00 $125.00 $54.00

$85.00 $93.47 $75.00 $40.00

$100.00 $122.24 $105.00 $49.00

$125.00 $142.50 $187.50 $56.00

$85.00 $93.47 $75.00 $40.00

$100.00 $122.24 $105.00 $49.00

$125.00 $142.50 $187.50 $56.00

$85.00 $37.24 $45.00 $29.00

$100.00 $56.48 $75.00 $38.00

$115.00 $73.37 $100.00 $48.00

$85.00 $55.86 $67.50 $31.00
$100.00 $84.72 $112.50 $40.00
$115.00 $110.05 $150.00 $51.00
$85.00 $55.86 $67.50 $31.00

$100.00 $84.72 $112.50 $40.00
$115.00 $110.05 $150.00 $51.00

NO BID $39.51 $40.00 $29.00

$54.62 $60.00 $38.00

$62.34 $85.00 $49.00

$59.27 $60.00 $31.00

$81.92 $90.00 $40.00

$93.50 $127.50 $41.00

$59.27 $60.00 $31.00

$81.92 $90.00 $40.00
$93.50 $127.50 $51.00


	Bids

